
THE NEWFOUNDLAND
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE

PART I
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. 98 ST. JOHN’S, FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 10, 2023 No. 45

CORPORATIONS ACT

NOTICE

IN THE MATTER of the Corporations Act, RSNL 1990, 
c.C-36 {the “Act”)

AND

IN THE MATTER of BENSON HOLDINGS LIMITED, 
in voluntary dissolution

TAKE NOTICE that following receipt of a special resolution 
of the Shareholders of BENSON HOLDINGS LIMITED 
(the “Corporation”) passed on the 25th day of October 2023 
to such effect, the Registrar of Corporations (NL) has issued 
a Certificate of Intent to Dissolve the Corporation, on a 
voluntary basis, which Certificate is dated the 31st day of 
October 2023.

AND FURTHER TAKE NOTICE that in accordance with the 
Act and the aforesaid special resolution, all the undertaking, 
properties, assets and liabilities of the Corporation shall now 
be distributed and discharged.

ACCORDINGLY, all persons claiming to be creditors 
of or have any claims or demands upon or affecting the 
Corporation, in voluntary dissolution, and who have not 
otherwise been notified and satisfactorily dealt with in this 
transaction to date are requested to send particulars of such 

demand to the undersigned Solicitors on or before the 1st day 
of December 2023.

DATED at St. John’s, Newfoundland and Labrador, Canada, 
this 31st day of October 2023.

BENSON BUFFETT PLC INC.
Solicitors for the Corporation

ATTENTION: JEFFREY P. BENSON, KC

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
P.O. Box 1538
St. John’s, NL AlC SN8

Tel:  (709) 570-7224
Email:  jbenson@bensonbuffett.com

Nov. 10

NOTICE

Corporations Act - Section 393
Local Incorporations
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-01 93075   Dr. Daniel Duggan 
   Professional Medical 
   Corporation
2023-07-01 93068   Jeremy Bennett Global 
   Mindset Training Inc.

417



2023-07-01 93069   Clean Air Solutions Inc.
2023-07-04 93095   FSC Consulting Ltd.
2023-07-04 93096   Small Chance 
   Newfoundland Inc.
2023-07-04 93070   NILKUMAR 
   HOLDINGS INC.
2023-07-04 93071   93071 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   & LABRADOR LIMITED
2023-07-04 93074   93074 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   & LABRADOR CORP.
2023-07-04 93076   Strong Bond 
   Newfoundland Inc.
2023-07-04 93077   93077 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR LIMITED
2023-07-04 93080   SHOAL POINT TRAIL INC.
2023-07-04 93081   STS Trucking Incorporated
2023-07-05 93097   Canadian Adventure 
   Charters Inc.
2023-07-05 93099   Dr. Ali Al-Ezzi 
   Professional Dental 
   Corporation
2023-07-05 93093   INDIAN FLAME INC.
2023-07-05 93094   OGorman Construction 
   and Renovations Inc.
2023-07-05 93098   Seaside Microgreens Ltd.
2023-07-05 93086   93086 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-05 93087   The Gold Method Ltd.
2023-07-05 93088   93088 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   & LABRADOR CORP.
2023-07-05 93091   Greenham’s Fishing Ltd.
2023-07-06 93117   Mobile Storage 
   Solutions Limited
2023-07-06 93100   Building up Families 
   Missions INC.
2023-07-06 93101   Bright Start Childcare Ltd.
2023-07-06 93102   Besties Cleaning Services Ltd.
2023-07-06 93104   Sean’s Fuels Limited
2023-07-07 93106   Dr. Elbaz Dentistry 
   Professional Corporation
2023-07-07 93109   Dyke’s Marine Inc.
2023-07-07 93110   93110 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   & LABRADOR CORP.
2023-07-07 93111   The Pearl Market Inc.
2023-07-07 93112   93112 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   & LABRADOR CORP.
2023-07-07 93113   Mahakal Foods Ltd.
2023-07-07 93114   Better Life Pharmaceutical 
   Services Corporation
2023-07-11 93138   Nexgen Resources Ltd.
2023-07-11 93115   Newfoundland 
   Gold Retriever Corp.
2023-07-11 93116   B&C Avani Fishing Corp.
2023-07-11 93119   Dr. Dorcus Ye and 
   Dr. Vincent Chia 
   Professional Medical
   Corporation
2023-07-11 93120   Excelsior Entities Inc.
2023-07-11 93121   CLICK INN DIGITAL CORP.
2023-07-12 93157   MGT Consulting Ltd.

2023-07-12 93142   Port Saunders 
   Development Committee Inc.
2023-07-12 93123   Cold Cabin Interactive Limited
2023-07-12 93124   Piusik Mining and Metals Inc.
2023-07-12 93125   Aldercroft Stewardship
   Corporation
2023-07-12 93126   Flora Developments Inc.
2023-07-12 93127   93127 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR
   INCORPORATED
2023-07-12 93128   ANTHONY AUTO LTD.
2023-07-13 93158   Reshape Consulting Inc.
2023-07-13 93131   Rogue Cycle Club Incorporated
2023-07-13 93132   SHAKTI HOLDINGS INC.
2023-07-13 93134   Ryall Consulting Services Inc.
2023-07-13 93139   93139 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR LIMITED
2023-07-13 93140   Atlantic Cleaning and 
  Detailing Ltd.
2023-07-13 93141   Billard’s Construction Ltd.
2023-07-13 93143   Chaisson’s Pharmacy Limited
2023-07-14 93155   PHOENIX
   MECHANICAL LTD.
2023-07-14 93175   Private Hire Incorporation
2023-07-14 93145   93145 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-14 93146   Goowiddy Geoscience Ltd.
2023-07-14 93148   Coffee Beings Hospitality Ltd.
2023-07-14 93149   PG Jacobs Fisheries Limited
2023-07-17 93181   GLNT Properties Inc.
2023-07-17 93152   Kabby Technologies Inc.
2023-07-17 93163   TIFFANY DAWN
   Aesthetics Inc.
2023-07-17 93167   93167 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-17 93168   DO ALL DRYWALL
  (BONAVISTA) LTD.
2023-07-17 93169   Dr. George Darby (Abdelmalek)
   Professional Medical
   Corporation
2023-07-17 93170   Popcorn NL Inc.
2023-07-17 93171   93171 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-17 93172   NL Clinical Trials Incorporated
2023-07-17 93173   Hillier’s Contracting &
   Rental Ltd.
2023-07-18 93191   93191 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR LIMITED
2023-07-18 93190   George Gibbons
   Holdings Limited
2023-07-18 93186   Gros Morne Landscaping
   & Property Maintenance Inc.
2023-07-18 93182   JWJ Consulting LTD.
2023-07-18 93188   PGDG Holdings Limited
2023-07-18 93174   GREEN’S HARBOUR
   EVENTS COMMITTEE INC.
2023-07-18 93177   Bailey MacKenzie
   Holdings Inc.
2023-07-18 93178   93178 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

418



2023-07-18 93179   East Coast Technical
   Services Inc.
2023-07-18 93180   Black Tiger
   Accounting Services Inc.
2023-07-19 93203   93203 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR LTD.
2023-07-19 93195   Bethany United
   Church Cemetery
   Committee Inc.
2023-07-19 93213   Connie & Sons
   Investments Ltd.
2023-07-19 93209   Dr. Fadhel Gazala
   Professional Dental
   Corporation 
2023-07-19 93200   Fireside Canteen Services Ltd.
2023-07-19 93196   GATEWAY CURLING
  CLUB INCORPORATED
2023-07-19 93205   Windy Bay
   Construction Solutions Inc.
2023-07-19 93184   BLH Holdings Inc.
2023-07-20 93228   ESH Counselling Inc.
2023-07-20 93192   Roberts Construction Limited
2023-07-20 93193   Accessible Blood
   Collection Solutions Inc.
2023-07-20 93194   Forever Gaming Inc.
2023-07-20 93198   93198 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR 
  CORPORATION
2023-07-20 93199   WEST NL HOLDINGS LTD.
2023-07-20 93201   East Coast Tile Inc.
2023-07-20 93202   RR GROUPS OF NL INC.
2023-07-21 93221   Annole Deep Shine
   Cleaning Inc.
2023-07-21 93214   BestDeal Clean
   Sweepers Limited
2023-07-21 93212   Brad Snow Auto Sales Inc.
2023-07-21 93215   Feral Soul Animal Rescue Inc.
2023-07-21 93227   VisualizedCare Inc.
2023-07-21 93204   The Missus Downstairs
   Season 3 Inc.
2023-07-21 93208   93208 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-21 93210   Love Your Health
   Massage Therapy Clinic Inc.
2023-07-24 93226   Dr. Jason Woodfine
   Professional Medical
   Corporation
2023-07-24 93217   Bursey Pharmacy Services Ltd.
2023-07-25 93218   Dr. James P. Thorburn
   PMC Inc.
2023-07-25 93223   Conception Bay South 
   Performing Arts
    Association Inc.
2023-07-25 93224   Kelly Financial Services Ltd.
2023-07-25 93229   Crosshair Consulting INC.
2023-07-26 93272   Dr. Rafal Munir PMC Inc.
2023-07-26 93239   Humber Arm South
   50+ Club Inc.
2023-07-26 93267   Maitree - The Bridge of 
   Cultures Inc.

2023-07-26 93234   H&H CLEANING 
  SERVICES LTD.
2023-07-26 93235   93235 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR CORP.
2023-07-27 93255   Chambers Contracting LTD.
2023-07-27 93252   HTA Holdings Inc.
2023-07-27 93254   Shelburne Holdings Limited
2023-07-28 93264   Avalon Edge Inc.
2023-07-28 93268   Long Range SAR Inc.
2023-07-28 93236   93236 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-28 93237   Gen 27:3 Holdings Inc.
2023-07-28 93238   Craig Hannam CPA
   Professional Corporation
2023-07-28 93240   Maritime Marine
   Brokerage Inc.
2023-07-28 93241   S. KRISHNASWAMY
   PROFESSIONAL DENTAL 
   CORPORATION
2023-07-31 93265   93265 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-31 93270   93270 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-31 93291   Dr. Kapilisha Natkunam 
   Professional Dental
   Corporation
2023-07-31 93249   Holiday Lanes 2023 Ltd.
2023-07-31 93257   Fairport Vendor Management
   & Procurement Services Inc.
2023-07-31 93258   Brightisle Canada Inc.
2023-07-31 93259   Wonderwall Events Limited
2023-07-31 93260   Curb Stomp Holdings Inc.
2023-07-31 93261   93261 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-31 93262   L & D Courier Services Inc.
2023-07-31 93263   Botwood Masonic
   Heritage Trust Inc.

Total Incorporations: 137

Corporations Act - Section 331
Local Revivals
For the Month of: July 2023

Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-20 72748   Clear Sky Roofing
   And Renovations Ltd.
2023-07-28 20233   Collins Construction Limited
 
Total Revivals: 2  

Corporations Act - Section 296 and 393
Local Continuances
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-26 93247   93247 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR INC.
 
Total Continuances: 1

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

419



Corporations Act - Section 286
Local Amendments
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-04 66500   DR. ANGUS JOHN HARTERY
   PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL 
   CORPORATION
2023-07-04 63720   MD Property Solutions Ltd.
2023-07-05 83757   83757 NEWFOUNDLAND
   AND LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-05 78422   Pinsent & Associates 
   Accounting Services Inc.
2023-07-05 78421   Pinsent & Associates
   CPA Professional Corporation
2023-07-05 17655   STARLITE AUDIO
   & ELECTRONICS LIMITED
2023-07-05 92333   Viking Pest Management Inc.
2023-07-06 83390   HWWB Investments Ltd. 
2023-07-06 84989   Modern Memorials Inc.
2023-07-07 86054   Q & R Dream Home
   Developers Inc. 
2023-07-07 71094   SEQUENCE 
   BIOINFORMATICS INC.
2023-07-11 93102   Besties Cleaning Services Ltd.
2023-07-12 93058   SMIT HOLDINGS INC.
2023-07-13 82725   2024 NL Summer Games
   Host Committee -
   Bay Roberts Inc.
2023-07-13 87243   AIX CAPITAL INC. 
2023-07-13 86529   ASL Innovations Corporation
2023-07-13 25604   SINGLE PARENT
   ASSOCIATION OF 
   NEWFOUNDLAND AND
   LABRADOR
2023-07-14 86458   Corrosion Control Limited
2023-07-14 82446   The Royal Newfoundland 
   Regiment Association Inc.
2023-07-17 20153   AIR COOLED ENGINE
   SERVICE LIMITED
2023-07-17 88708   Bright Minds Learning
   Centre Inc.
2023-07-18 90055   Signage Clothing & Crafts Inc.
2023-07-20 80005   80005 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
2023-07-20 87584   CL Zorbit’s Carnegie
   Learning Canada Inc.
2023-07-20 72748   Clear Sky Roofing
   And Renovations Ltd.
2023-07-20 92854   Paradise Management Inc.
2023-07-20 51178   W.A.K.O.- NL INC.
2023-07-21 42693   FLAMBRO HEAD HERITAGE
   SOCIETY INC.
2023-07-21 51862   FOX MARSH TRAILER
   PARK INC.
2023-07-21 87718   John Michael Maxwell M.D. 
   Professional Medical 
   Corporation
2023-07-21 8696   MCCURDY ENTERPRISES 
  LIMITED
2023-07-21 90362   Understandable Concepts
   PLC Inc.

2023-07-25 39859   KPD Financial Services Inc.
2023-07-25 93158   Reshape Consulting Inc.
2023-07-26 36994   Dajen Enterprises Inc.
2023-07-26 45710   Eastern Inspection Incorporated
2023-07-26 93032   Granite Maritime Inc.
2023-07-26 79574   LOEB PROFESSIONAL
   LAW CORPORATION
2023-07-26 40220   Marathon Holdings Inc.
2023-07-27 59865   59865 NEWFOUNDLAND 
   AND LABRADOR LIMITED
2023-07-27 81440   Saucy Mouth Inc. 
2023-07-28 84642   Harris Street Holdings Limited
2023-07-31 82262   Dr. Almutawa PMC Inc.
2023-07-31 68074   DR. AMANDA SCOTT 
   PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL
   CORPORATION
2023-07-31 92660   MUP Restaurant Inc.
2023-07-31 39171   Pradie Enterprises Incorporated
2023-07-31 80186   Steel Summer Property Ltd.
 
Total Amendments: 47

Corporations Act - Section 337
Local Intents to Dissolve
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-07 77831   Family Tree Medical Inc.
 
Total Intents to Dissolve: 1

Corporations Act - Section 335
Local Dissolutions
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-04 89565   FFS & Rentals Ltd. 
2023-07-06 62288   MOBILE DIESEL 
   DIAGNOSTICS INC.
2023-07-06 70484   Promana Consulting Inc.
2023-07-06 90642   Y.Q.R. Investments Inc.
2023-07-07 70720   A++ ELECTRICAL INC.
2023-07-07 70812   ABBOTT CONSTRUCTION
   & CONTRACTING INC.
2023-07-07 77831   Family Tree Medical Inc.
2023-07-11 46246   Beothuk Helicopters Inc.
2023-07-11 46249   Bluecrest Holdings Inc.
2023-07-11 79327   For Your Independence
   Home & Safety Ltd
2023-07-11 45041   Kelly Pharmacy Holdings Ltd.
2023-07-11 62963   MATCHIM & ASSOCIATES
   INSURANCE INC.
2023-07-11 35525   Sou’wester Outfitting Inc.
2023-07-12 31738   M & S ENTERPRISES INC.
2023-07-13 88182   APK Management
   Services, Inc.
2023-07-13 3533   DOYLE REALTY LIMITED
2023-07-13 45985   Ford Enterprise Inc
2023-07-13 62568   Orion Group Atlantic Limited
2023-07-14 48828   St. Catherine’s Renewal
   Centre Incorporated
2023-07-17 82604   D.C. Wells Holdings Ltd.

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

420



2023-07-17 50896   DEBOURKE
   ENTERPRISES INC.
2023-07-17 85400   Dr. Al-Mehiawi Professional 
   Medical Corporation
2023-07-17 28755   LARRY REID & 
   SONS CO. LTD.
2023-07-17 50885   RIVENDELL 
   HOLDINGS INC.
2023-07-17 36160   Wiscombe’s
   Enterprises Limited
2023-07-19 73400   Fireside Cafe &
   Food Service Ltd.
2023-07-19 67334   FIRESIDE FOOD
   SERVICES LTD.
2023-07-19 88263   The Bubble Tree Ltd. 
2023-07-19 21303   WAY’S PHARMACY
   LIMITED
2023-07-20 39270   GOULDING
   ENTERPRISES LIMITED
2023-07-21 79543   Blue Vine Industries Ltd.
2023-07-21 60046   E & C MECHANICAL
   LIMITED
2023-07-21 26066   McCURDY CONTRACTING
   LIMITED
2023-07-21 86284   Summer Bistro Ltd.
2023-07-24 27500   DRK Holdings Limited
2023-07-24 37330   Elizabeth Alteen Incorporated
2023-07-24 44153   NORRIS ARM 
   LIONS CLUB INC.
2023-07-24 90956   Songbird Counselling Inc.
2023-07-25 87801   Freeman Fisheries Inc.
2023-07-27 88978   The Skin Lab Inc.
2023-07-28 76253   Gander Veterinary
   Clinic Limited
2023-07-31 87012   Fogo Island Honey Incorporated
2023-07-31 45142   NIMO Transport Ltd.
2023-07-31 90713   Whiskey Barrel Ltd.
 
Total Dissolutions: 44

Corporations Act - Section 299
Local Discontinuances
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-04 59369   TAKE THE SHOT 
   PRODUCTIONS INC.
2023-07-11 85265   HALLMARK DENTAL
   LABORATORY (NL)
   LIMITED
2023-07-12 89435   DR. MARCOS PORTO TREIN
   PROFESSIONAL DENTAL 
   CORPORATION
 
Total Discontinuances: 3  

Corporations Act - Section 294
Local Amalgamations
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-01 93084   YELLOW FOX
   PROPERTIES INC.
From:  52019 STACK REALTY INC.
 88928 Yellow Fox Properties Inc. 
 
Total Amalgamations: 1

Corporations Act - Section 286
Local Name Changes
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Number     Company Name
78422     Pinsent & 
   Associates Accounting
  Services Inc.
2023-07-05  From:     Pinsent Bartlett
   Accounting Services Inc.
 
78421     Pinsent & Associates
   CPA Professional Corporation
2023-07-05  From:     Pinsent Bartlett
   CPA Professional Corporation
 
83390     HWWB Investments Ltd. 
2023-07-06  From:     H&W Investments Ltd. 
 
93102     Besties Cleaning Services Ltd.
2023-07-11  From:     93102 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR LTD.
 
93058     SMIT HOLDINGS INC.
2023-07-12  From:     93058 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
 
82725     2024 NL Summer Games
   Host Committee - 
   Bay Roberts Inc.
2023-07-13  From:     2020 Newfoundland and
   Labrador Summer Games
   Host Committee - 
   Town of Bay Roberts Inc.
 
86529     ASL Innovations Corporation
2023-07-13  From:     86529 NEWFOUNDLAND
   & LABRADOR INC.
 
82446     The Royal Newfoundland 
   Regiment Association Inc.
2023-07-14  From:     Royal Newfoundland Regiment 
   Association Inc.
 

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

421



87584     CL Zorbit’s Carnegie
   Learning Canada Inc.
2023-07-20  From:     CL Zorbit’s Inc.
 
92854     Paradise Management Inc.
2023-07-20  From:     Paradise Management Inc.
 
51178     W.A.K.O.- NL INC.
2023-07-20  From:     KICKBOXING
   NEWFOUNDLAND &
   LABRADOR INC.

87718     John Michael Maxwell M.D. 
   Professional Medical 
   Corporation
2023-07-21  From:     John Michael Maxwell
   Professional Medical 
   Corporation
 
90362     Understandable Concepts
   PLC Inc.
2023-07-21  From:     Understandable Concepts Inc.
 
93158     Reshape Consulting Inc.
2023-07-25  From:     Area Seven Inc.
 
93032     Granite Maritime Inc.
2023-07-26  From:     Granite Maritime Inc.
 
92660     MUP Restaurant Inc.
2023-07-31  From:     MUP DQ Valley Inc.
  
Total Name Changes: 16

Corporations Act - Section 443
Extra-Provincial Registrations
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-04 93103   Take the Shot Productions Inc.
2023-07-05 93166   Distribution All-in Plus inc.
2023-07-05 93108   FAT BASTARD 
   ENTERPRISES INC.
2023-07-05 93107   MOBILECOMM
   TECHNOLOGIES 
   CANADA INC.
2023-07-06 93118   EBSD Holdings Ltd.
2023-07-07 93133   Dymond Aerospace Inc.
2023-07-07 93147   LLOYD SADD
   CONSULTING LTD.
2023-07-07 93135   The Dymond Group Inc.
2023-07-11 93130   AlmatarnehEstate Inc.
2023-07-11 93144   HALLMARK DENTAL 
   LABORATORY (NL)
   LIMITED
2023-07-11 93129   Musafir Immigration
   Solutions Inc.
2023-07-11 93137   RPM CANADA
   HOLDING II ULC

2023-07-12 93156   AIR MILES Loyalty Inc.
2023-07-12 93165   AVANTE MINING CORP.
2023-07-12 93154   OURCROWD CANADA INC.
2023-07-12 93161   RATESHOP INC.
2023-07-13 93160   13264793 CANADA
   CORPORATION
2023-07-13 93159   15132738 Canada Inc.
2023-07-13 93162   MILLIPORESIGMA 
   CANADA LTD. / 
   MILLIPORESIGMA 
   CANADA LTÉE
2023-07-14 93153   15168279 Canada Inc.
2023-07-17 93189   ALDER HOLDINGS, LLC
2023-07-17 93183   JMS ACCOUNTANT
   STAFFING LIMITED
2023-07-18 93185   5 STAR VIBES
   ENTERTAINMENT INC.
2023-07-18 93197   EASTERN SHIPPING
   WORLDWIDE, INC.
2023-07-18 93187   NORD EAST TRADING 
   COMPANY INC.
2023-07-18 93206   SABRAW
   ENTERPRISES LTD.
2023-07-20 93220   ENPROTECH
   CANADA CORP.
2023-07-20 93219   L’UNION-VIE, COMPAGNIE
    MUTUELLE D’ASSURANCE
   THE UNION LIFE MUTUAL 
  ASSURANCE COMPANY
2023-07-20 93216   PMI Alliance Group Inc.
2023-07-20 93222   VERDANT 
   ENVIRONMENTAL
   TECHNOLOGIES INC.
   TECHNOLOGIES 
   ENVIRONNEMENTALES
   VERDANT INC.
2023-07-21 93225   12974631 Canada Inc.
2023-07-24 93233   ADPEARL INC.
2023-07-24 93230   EAS PARTNERCO ULC
2023-07-24 93231   REMAIN PARTNERCO ULC
2023-07-25 93244   2508436 Alberta ULC
2023-07-25 93245   ANNTOL HOLDINGS INC.
2023-07-25 93246   HUNTER
   ENGINEERING COMPANY 
2023-07-25 93243   POWERSCHOOL
   CANADA ULC
2023-07-25 93232   Ukrainian National Federation
   of Canada (Avalon Branch)
   Fédération Nationale 
   Ukrainienne du Canada (Filiale 
   Avalon)
2023-07-26 93290   Garda Alarm Services
   Services Corporation 
   Corporation de services 
   d’alarmes Garda
2023-07-26 93273   PRESIMA SECURITIES ULC
2023-07-27 93251   Leeth Canada Inc.
2023-07-27 93250   RSG Insurance Services
   of Canada Limited

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

422



2023-07-27 93256   TC BIZZ..COM CORP.
2023-07-27 93253   WK Kellogg Canada Corp.
2023-07-28 93269   SCOTT GANNON 
   FINANCIAL INC.
2023-07-31 93438   ADDÉNERGIE
   TECHNOLOGIES INC.
2023-07-31 93289   LOCKTON RE BROKERS, 
   ULC
 
Total Registrations: 48

Corporations Act - Section 451
Extra-Provincial Name Changes
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Number     Company Name
93176     FUTURA PROPERTIES LTD.
2023-07-13 From:    1299831 B.C. LTD.
 89270     Latitude Uranium Inc.
2023-07-13 From:    LABRADOR URANIUM INC.
 
74908     NUVONA LTD.
2023-07-20 From:    NATIONAL SMOKELESS 
   TOBACCO COMPANY 
   LIMITED/
   COMPAGNIE DE TABAC 
   SANS FUMEE NATIONALE 
   LIMITEE
 
93242     ARALEZ 
   PHARMACEUTICALS 
   CANADA INC.
2023-07-25 From:    NUVO PHARMACEUTICALS
    INC.
 
90214     EMBECTA CANADA CO.
2023-07-26 From:    EMBECTA NOVA SCOTIA 
   COMPANY/COMPAGNIE 
   EMBECTA DE LA 
   NOUVELLE-ÉCOSSE
 
80162     SALTHILL PROPERTY
   MANAGEMENT INC.
2023-07-26 From:    STRATHALLEN PROPERTY
   MANAGEMENT INC.
 
74908     NUVONA LTÉE
2023-07-27 From:    NUVONA LTD.
 
90693     Pleasant Ridge Properties Ltd.
2023-07-28 From:    639279 NB LTD.
 
Total Name Changes: 8

Corporations Act - Section 294
Extra-Provincial Registrations for Amalgamation
For the Month of: July 2023
  
Date Number   Company Name
2023-07-11 93136   RPM CANADA HOLDING
   I ULC
From:  90376 RPM CANADA COMPANY
   FINANCE ULC
 91472 RPM CANADA 
  INVESTMENT COMPANY
   ULC
 
2023-07-12 93164   DIVERSEY CANADA, INC.
From:  84102 DIVERSEY CANADA, INC.
 
2023-07-13 93176   FUTURA PROPERTIES LTD.
From:  49718 FUTURA PROPERTIES LTD.
 
2023-07-18 93207   SALESFORCE.COM
   CANADA CORPORATION
From:  70077 SALESFORCE.COM 
  CANADA CORPORATION
 
2023-07-18 93211   SALESFORCE.COM
   CANADA CORPORATION
From:  93207 SALESFORCE.COM
   CANADA CORPORATION
 
2023-07-21 93278   MILLENNIUM RESEARCH 
   GROUP INC.
From:  87208 MILLENNIUM RESEARCH 
  GROUP INC. 
 59812 PROQUEST INFORMATION 
  ACCESS CORP.
 
2023-07-25 93242   ARALEZ 
   PHARMACEUTICALS
   CANADA INC.
From:  80928 Aralez Pharmaceuticals
   Canada Inc. 
 
2023-07-26 93298   MILL CREEK
   MOTOR FREIGHT LTD.
From:  90938 MILL CREEK
   MOTOR FREIGHT LTD.
 
2023-07-27 93248   ATS TRAFFIC LTD.
From:  83196 ATS TRAFFIC - 
  ALBERTA LTD. 
 
Total Registrations for Amalgamation: 9

Nov. 10

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

423



CHANGE OF NAME ACT, 2009

NOTICE

Under the authority vested in me by the Change of Name Act, 2009, SNL2009 cC-8-1, I hereby certify the following names have 
been changed.

Nov. 10

R
ep

or
t f

or
 A

ug
us

t 2
02

3.
D

at
ed

 th
is

 3
0th

 d
ay

 o
f O

ct
ob

er
, 2

02
3.

D
IG

IT
A

L 
G

O
V

ER
N

M
EN

T 
&

 S
ER

V
IC

E 
N

L
Sh

ee
na

 G
ou

gh
, R

eg
is

tra
r o

f V
ita

l S
ta

tis
tic

s

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

424



NOTICE

Under the authority vested in me by the Change of Name Act, 2009, SNL2009 cC-8-1, I hereby certify the following names have 
been changed.

Nov. 10

R
ep

or
t f

or
 S

ep
te

m
be

r 2
02

3.
D

at
ed

 th
is

 3
0th

 d
ay

 o
f O

ct
ob

er
, 2

02
3.

D
IG

IT
A

L 
G

O
V

ER
N

M
EN

T 
&

 S
ER

V
IC

E 
N

L
Sh

ee
na

 G
ou

gh
, R

eg
is

tra
r o

f V
ita

l S
ta

tis
tic

s

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

425



LANDS ACT

NOTICE OF INTENT, SECTION 7
LANDS ACT, SNL1991 c36 AS AMENDED

NOTICE IS HEREBY given that an application has 
been made to the Department of Fisheries, Forestry and 
Agriculture Branch, to acquire title, pursuant to section 7(2) 
(d) of the said Act, to that piece of Crown lands situated 
within 15 metres of the waters of Solomon’s Pond, for the 
purpose of a recreational walking trail.

The application may intrude on the 15 metre shoreline of the 
above mentioned water body(s) in various locations. For a 
detailed map, please see website: https://www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/
lands/sec7notifications/.

Please note: It may take up to five (5) days from the date of 
application for details to appear on the website.

Any person wishing to object to the application must file 
the objection in writing with reasons, within 30 days from 
the publication of notice on the Department of Fisheries, 
Forestry and Agriculture website, Crown Lands,  https://
www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/, to the Minister of  Department of 
Fisheries, Forestry and Agriculture by mail or email to the 
nearest Regional Lands Office:

●   Eastern Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 8700, Howley 
Building, Higgins Line, St. John’s, NL, A1B 4J6               
Email: easternlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

●   Central Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2222, Gander, 
NL, A1V 2N9  Email: centrallandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

●   Western Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2006,  
Sir Richard Squires Building, Corner Brook, NL,  
A2H 6J8   Email: westernregionlands@gov.nl.ca

●   Labrador Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 3014, 
Station “B”, Happy Valley-Goose Bay, NL, A0P 1E0                          
Email: labradorlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

(DISCLAIMER: The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 
publishes a NOTICE OF INTENT as received from the 
Applicant and takes no responsibility for errors or omissions 
in the property being more particularly described.)

Nov. 10

URBAN AND RURAL PLANNING ACT, 2000

NOTICE OF REGISTRATION
TOWN OF HAROUR GRACE

MUNICIPAL PLAN 
AMENDMENT No. 5, 2023, and

DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS 
AMENDMENT No. 6, 2023

TAKE NOTICE that the TOWN OF HARBOUR GRACE 
MUNICIPAL PLAN AMENDMENT NO. 5, 2023, and 

DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS AMENDMENT 
NO. 6, 2023, as adopted by Council on the 18th day of 
September, 2023, has been registered by the Minister of 
Municipal and Provincial Affairs.  

IN GENERAL TERMS, MUNICIPAL PLAN 
AMENDMENT NO. 5, 2023, will redesignate land on 
the southside of Water Street west from Industrial to Town.  
DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS AMENDMENT 
NO. 6, 2023, will rezone the same area of land from 
Industrial (IND) to Town (TN).

THE TOWN OF HARBOUR GRACE MUNICIPAL 
PLAN AMENDMENT NO. 5, 2023, and  
DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS AMENDMENT 
NO. 6, 2023, comes into effect on the day that this 
notice is published in The Newfoundland and Labrador 
Gazette. Anyone who wishes to inspect a copy of the 
TOWN OF HARBOUR GRACE MUNICIPAL PLAN 
AMENDMENT NO. 5, 2023, and DEVELOPMENT 
REGULATIONS AMENDMENT NO. 6, 2023, may 
do so at the Town Office, Harbour Grace during normal 
working hours.

TOWN OF HARBOUR GRACE 
AMY DWYER, TOWN CLERK/MANAGER

Nov. 10

TRUSTEE ACT

ESTATE NOTICE

IN THE MATTER OF the Estate of SYLVIA JAMES, 
of Bryant’s Cove, in the Province of Newfoundland and 
Labrador, deceased.

ALL PERSONS claiming to be creditors of, or who have 
any claims or demands upon or affecting, the Estate of the 
late SYLVIA JAMES, of Bryant’s Cove, in the Province 
of Newfoundland and Labrador, deceased, who died at 
Carbonear in the Province of Newfoundland and Labrador 
on or about the 14th day of July, 2022, are hereby requested 
to send particulars thereof in writing, duly attested, to the 
undersigned Solicitor for the Executor of the said deceased, 
on or before the 30th day of November, 2023, after which 
date the Executor will proceed to distribute the said Estate 
having regard only to the claim(s) of which he then shall 
have had notice.

DATED at Carbonear, in the Province of Newfoundland and 
Labrador, this 24th day of October, 2023.

BABB LAW OFFICE
Solicitors for the Executor

PER: JOHN M. BABB, K.C.

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
P.O. Box 400
18 Goff Avenue
Carbonear, NL  AIY 1B8

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

426



Tel:  (709) 596-2377
Toll Free:  1-800-596-0596
Fax:  (709) 596-0415
Email:  babblaw@babblaw.ca

Nov. 3 & 10

ESTATE NOTICE 

IN THE ESTATE OF BODIL LARSEN, late of Logy Bay-
Middle Cove-Outer Cove, in the Province of Newfoundland 
and Labrador, Retired, Deceased.

ALL PERSONS claiming to be creditors of or who have 
any claims or demands upon or affecting the Estate of 
BODIL LARSEN Retired, Deceased, who died at St. 
John’s, in the Province of Newfoundland and Labrador on 
or about the 28th day of August 2023, are hereby requested 
to send particulars thereof in writing, duly attested, to the 
undersigned as Executor of the Estate of the late BODIL 
LARSEN on or before the 8th day of December, 2023, after 
which date the said Executor will. proceed to distribute the 
said Estate having regard only to the claims of which they
shall then have had notice.

Dated at St. John’s, in the Province of Newfoundland and 
Labrador, this 2nd day of November, 2022.

MCINNES COOPER
as Executor of the estate of the late BODIL LARSEN

PER: ROBERT J. HICKEY, SOLICITOR

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
10 Fort William Place, 5th Floor
PO Box 5939
St. John’s, NL  A1C 5X4

Tel:  (709) 570-7370
Fax:  (709) 722-1763

Nov. 10

ESTATE NOTICE 

IN THE ESTATE of BERNARD BENEDICT MULLALY 
of Northern Bay, in the Province of Newfoundland and 
Labrador, deceased.

ALL PERSONS claiming to be creditors of, or who have 
any claims or demands upon or affecting the Estate of the 
late BERNARD BENEDICT MULLALY, of Northern 
Bay, in the Province of Newfoundland and Labrador, 
deceased, are hereby requested to send particulars thereof 
in writing, duly attested, to the undersigned, Solicitors for 
the Executrix of the said deceased, on or before the 30th 

day of November, 2023, after which date the Executrix will 
proceed to distribute the said Estate having regard only to 
the claim(s) of which she then shall have had notice.

DATED at Carbonear, in the Province of Newfoundland and 
Labrador, this 6th day of November, 2023.

BABB LAW OFFICE
Solicitors for the Executrix

PER: JOHN M. BABB, K.C.

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
P.O. Box 400
18 Goff Avenue
Carbonear, NL  AIY 1B8

Tel:  (709) 596-2377
Toll Free:  1-800-596-0596
Fax:  (709) 596-0415
Email:  babblaw@babblaw.ca

Nov. 10

ESTATE NOTICE

IN THE MATTER OF the Estate and Effects of BLANCHE 
ROBERTS of Twillingate, in the Province of Newfoundland 
and Labrador, homemaker, Deceased.

ALL PERSONS Claiming to be creditors of or who have any 
claims or demands upon or affecting the Estate of Blanche 
Roberts, the aforesaid deceased, who died at Twillingate, in 
the Province of Newfoundland and Labrador on or about 
the 22nd day of November, 2022, are hereby requested to 
send particulars thereof in writing, duly attested, to the 
undersigned Solicitor for the Administratrix of the Estate on 
or before the 13th day of November, 2023 after which date 
the Administratrix will proceed to distribute the said Estate 
having regard only to the claims of which she shall then have 
had notice.

DATED at the Town of Twillingate, Newfoundland and 
Labrador, this 26th day of October, 2023.

PEDDLE LAW
Solicitor for the Administratrix

PER: MICHAEL D. PEDDLE

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
Peddle Law
P.O. Box 518
38 Main Street
Twillingate, NL  A0G 4M0

Tel:  (709) 884-1751
Fax:  (709) 702-0799

Nov. 3 & 10

ESTATE NOTICE

IN THE MATTER OF the Estate and Effects of late CAROL 
FAYE WALSH of Gander, in the Province of Newfoundland 
and Labrador, retired person, widow, Deceased.

ALL PERSONS claiming to be creditors of or who have any 
claims or demands upon or affecting the Estate of CAROL 
FAYE WALSH, the aforesaid deceased, who died at St. 
John’s, in the Province of Newfoundland and Labrador on 

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

427



or about the 11th day of August, 2023, are hereby requested 
to send particulars thereof in writing, duly attested, to the 
undersigned Solicitor for the Executors of the Estate on or 
before the 13th day of November, 2023 after which date the 
Executors will proceed to distribute the said Estate having 
regard only to the claims of which they shall then have had 
notice.

DATED at the Town of Gander, Newfoundland and 
Labrador, this 20th day of October, 2023.

PEDDLE LAW
Solicitor for the Executors

PER: MICHAEL D. PEDDLE

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
Peddle Law
P.O.Box563
137 Bennett Drive
Gander, NL AlV 2El

Tel:  (709) 651-4949
Fax:  (709) 651-4951

Nov. 3 & 10

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

428



THE NEWFOUNDLAND
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE

PART II
SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION 

FILED UNDER THE STATUTES AND SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION ACT

Vol. 98 ST. JOHN’S, FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 10, 2023 No. 45

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR
REGULATION

NLR 84/23





 

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
REGULATION 84/23 

Income and Employment Support Regulations (Amendment) 
under the  

Income and Employment Support Act 
(O.C. 2023-255) 

(Filed November 9, 2023) 

Under the authority of section 52 of the Income and Employment 
Support Act, the Lieutenant-Governor in Council makes the following 
regulations. 

Dated at St. John’s, November 9, 2023. 

Krista Quinlan 
Clerk of the Executive Council 

REGULATIONS 

Analysis 

 1.  S.19 Amdt. 
Other income support 

 2.  Commencement 
 

 1. (1) Subsection 19(2) of the Income and Employment Support 
Regulations is amended by deleting the amount "$125" wherever it 
appears and substituting the amount "$175".  

NLR 144/04  
as amended 

593The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette November 10, 2023



  Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

84/23  

 

  

 (2) Subsection 19(3) of the regulations is amended by 
deleting the amount "$125" and substituting the amount "$175". 

 2. These regulations come into force on November 15, 2023. 

©King's Printer 

Commencement 

594The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette November 10, 2023



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

595

Index
PART I

Change of Names Act, 2009 – Notices .......................................................................................................................................... 424
Corporations Act – Notices ............................................................................................................................................................ 417
Lands Act – Notices ....................................................................................................................................................................... 426
Trustee Act – Notices  .................................................................................................................................................................... 426
Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000 – Notice .............................................................................................................................. 426
            

PART II
CONTINUING INDEX OF SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION

  
Title of Act and  
Subordinate Legislation  
made thereunder

CNLR or 
NL Reg. Amendment

NL Gazette 
Date & Page No.

Income and Employment Support Act

Income and Employment Support
  Regulations (Amendment)

[In force November 15, 2023]

NLR 84/23 Amends
NLR 144/04
S.19 Amdt.

Nov.  10/23     p. 593



The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette is published from the Office of the Kings’s Printer.

Copy for publication must be received by Friday, 4:30 p.m., seven days before publication date to ensure inclusion in next issue. 
Advertisements must be submitted in either PDF format or as a MSWord file.  When this is not possible, advertisements must be 
either, typewritten or printed legibly, separate from covering letter. Number of insertions required must be stated and the names 
of all signing officers typewritten or printed. 

Copy may be mailed to the address below, faxed to (709) 729-1900 or emailed to kingsprinter@gov.nl.ca.
Subscription rate for The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette is $144.38 for 52 weeks plus 15% HST ($166.04). Weekly issues, 
$3.47 per copy, plus 15% HST ($3.99) payable in advance.

All cheques, money orders, etc., should be made payable to THE NEWFOUNDLAND EXCHEQUER ACCOUNT and all 
correspondence should be addressed to: Office of the King’s Printer, P. O. Box 8700, Ground Floor, East Block, Confederation 
Building, St. John’s, NL A1B 4J6, Telephone: (709) 729-3649,  Fax: (709) 729-1900.

Web Site: www.gov.nl.ca/snl/printer/gazette/weekly-issues

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette
Advertising Rates

Prices effective July 1, 2016

Notices  Rate  15%  HST  Total
Lands Act - Notice of Intent - 1 week $31.13 $4.67 $35.80
Motor Carrier Act - Notice - 1 week $39.90 $5.99 $45.89
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 1 week $34.65 $5.20 $39.85
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 2 weeks $62.37 $9.36 $71.73
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 3 weeks $91.25 $13.69 $104.94
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 4 weeks $118.97 $17.85 $136.82

All other public notices required by law to be published in The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette, eg., Corporations Act, 
Municipalities Act, Quieting of Titles Act, Urban and Rural Planning Act, etc., are priced according to size: for Single Column  
$3.47 per cm or Double Column $6.93 per cm, plus 15% HST.

For quotes please contact the Office of the King’s Printer kingsprinter@gov.nl.ca

Government Information Product
Publication Rate Mail
G.S.T. # R107442683

596

THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
November 10, 2023

596


	https://www.gov.nl.ca/dgsnl/printer/gazette/weekly-issues/
	PART I
	CORPORATIONS ACT
	CHANGE OF NAME ACT, 2009
	LANDS ACT
	TRUSTEE ACT

	PART II
	REGULATION 84/23 Income and Employment Support Regulations (Amendment)

	Index

