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application must be served with claim and notice of the hearing 10 clear days 
prior to the hearing date and, where the respondent fails to attend the hearing, 
Rule 29.11(1) states that the hearing may proceed in the respondent’s absence 
so long as he has been properly served.  Landlord1 testified that she had 
personally served the tenant with notice of the hearing on 28 November 2019 
and he has had 46 days to provide a response.  As the tenant was properly 
served, and as any further delay in these proceedings would unfairly 
disadvantage the landlords, I proceeded with the hearing in his absence. 
 

7. Landlord1 stated that the tenant vacated the rented premises sometime in late 
November 2019 and I accordingly amended the application and removed the 
landlords’ claim for an order for vacant possession. 

 
 
Issue 1: Rent - $3085.00 
 
Relevant Submissions 
 
8. Landlord1 stated that she had entered into a monthly rental agreement with the 

tenant in October 2018.  The agreed rent was set at $1350.00. 
 

9. The tenant fell into rental arrears shortly after he had moved into the rental unit.  
Although he did make regular rental payments to the landlords during his 
tenancy, he was sometimes short on the rent that was required to be paid and 
the balance owing steadily increased. 

 
10. On 10 October 2019 landlord1 issued the tenant a termination notice and a copy 

of that notice was submitted with the landlords’ application.  That notice was 
issued under section 19 of the Residential Tenancies Act, 2018 (notice where 
failure to pay rent) and it had an effective termination date of 21 October 2019.  
Landlord1 stated that the tenant moved out sometime in November 2019. 

 
11. With their application the landlords submitted their rent records showing the 

payments they had received from the tenants since he had moved in.  According 
to these records, the tenant only paid a total of $15,140.00 during his 13 month 
tenancy while the landlords ought to have received $17,550.00 for the period 
ending 31 October 2019. 

 
12. The landlords are seeking an order for the difference of these 2 amounts: 

$2410.00. 
 

Analysis 
 

13. I accept landlord1’s claim that the tenant had not paid rent as required and I 
accept her evidence which shows that the tenant owes $2410.00.  As such, the 
landlords’ claim succeeds in that amount. 
 






