
    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

THE NEWFOUNDLAND 
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 

Part II 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

   
 ST. JOHN'S, TUESDAY, APRIL 1, 2008   

 
 
 
 

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR  
REGULATION 

 
19/08 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



  
 

Extraordinary Gazette  April 1, 2008 
 

3

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
REGULATION 19/08 

Income and Employment Support Regulations  
(Amendment)  

under the  
Income and Employment Support Act  

(O.C. 2008-088)  

(Filed April 1, 2008) 

Under the authority of section 52 of the Income and Support Act, 
the Lieutenant-Governor in Council makes the following regulations. 

Dated at St. John’s, March 28, 2008. 

Gary Norris  
Clerk of the Executive Council  

REGULATIONS 

Analysis 

 1.  S.13 Amdt 
Maintaining a residence 

 2.  S.14 R&S 
Maximum monthly income 
support-board and lodging 

 3.  S.15 Amdt. 
Income support for persons 
30 years of age and younger 

 1. Subsection 13(1) of the Income and Employment Support 
Regulations is repealed and the following substituted: 

NLR 144/04 
as amended 



 Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

19/08 

 

Extraordinary Gazette  April 1, 2008 
 

4

 13. (1) The monthly amount of income support for an applicant or 
recipient who is renting or owns a residence is up to  

 
1 adult  without dependent children  $465  
1 adult  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

659  

1 adult  without dependent children 
but with two dependent stu-
dents  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
1 adult  with dependent children  604  
1 adult  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
647  

1 adult  with dependent children but 
with two dependent students  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  without dependent children  659  
2 adults  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  with dependent children  647  
2 adults  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

 2. Section 14 of the regulations is repealed and the following 
substituted: 

 14. (1) The monthly amount of income support for an applicant or 
recipient who is boarding with a non-relative is 

 
1 adult  without dependent children  $465  
1 adult  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

659  

1 adult  without dependent children 
and two dependent students  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

Maintaining a 
residence 

 

Maximum monthly 
income support-
board and lodging 



 Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

19/08 

 

Extraordinary Gazette  April 1, 2008 
 

5

dependent student  
1 adult  with dependent children  604  
1 adult  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
647  

1 adult  with dependent children and 
two dependent students  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  without dependent children  659  
2 adults  without dependent children 

and one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

2 adults  with dependent children  647  
2 adults  with dependent children with 

one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

 (2) The monthly amount of income support for board and lodg-
ing for an applicant or recipient who is boarding with a relative is 

 
1 adult  without dependent children  $282  
1 adult  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

559  

1 adult  with dependent children  497  
1 adult  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
647 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

2 adults  without dependent children  559  
2 adults  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  with dependent children  647  
2 adults  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  



 Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

19/08 

 

Extraordinary Gazette  April 1, 2008 
 

6

 3. (1) Subsection 15(1) of the regulations is amended by delet-
ing the amount "$221" and replacing it with the amount "$224". 

 (2) Paragraph 15(2)(a) of the regulations is amended by 
deleting the amount "$105" and replacing it with the amount 
"$107". 

 (3) Paragraph 15(2)(b) of the regulations is amended by 
deleting the amount "$152" and replacing it with the amount 
"$154".  

 (4) Subsection 15(3) is of the regulations amended by delet-
ing the amount "$435" and replacing it with the amount "$442". 

©Earl G. Tucker, Queen's Printer 

 



 7

  
 ST. JOHN'S, TUESDAY, APRIL 1, 2008 

  
 
 

 

Index 
 
Title of Act and 
Subordinate Legislation CNLR or  NL Gazette 
made thereunder NL Reg. Amendment Date & Page No.  
 
 
Income and Employment  
Support Act 
 
 Income and Employment NLR 19/08 Amends April 1/08     p. 3 
 Support Regulations  NLR144/04 
 (Amdt)  S. 13 Amdt. 
    S. 14 R&S 
    S. 15 Amdt. 
     
 
 


	Queen's Printer Web Site

	Index
	REGULATION
	19/08






