
 105

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

THE NEWFOUNDLAND 
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE 

 
PART I 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Vol. 83   ST. JOHN’S, FRIDAY, APRIL 4, 2008 No. 14 

MINERAL ACT 

CORRECTION NOTICE 

The Mineral Notice published March 28, 2008 in The 
Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette was reprinted in 
error.  The official publication date was March 20, 2008. 

JIM HINCHEY P.GEO 
Manager - Mineral Rights 

 
Apr 4 

NOTICE 
 

Published in accordance with section 62 of CNLR 1143/96 
under the Mineral Act, cM-12, RSNL 1990 as amended. 
 
Mineral License  005276M 
Held by    Galen Gypsum Mines Limited 
Situate near   Flat Bay Brook,Western NL 
On map sheet   12B/08         
 
Mineral License  011508M 
Held by    Ucore Uranium Inc. 
Situate near   West Micmac Lake 
On map sheet   13J/12         
 

Mineral License  012668M 
Held by    Vulcan Minerals Inc. 
Situate near   Big Otter Pond,Southwest NL 
On map sheet   12B/01  12B/02       
 
 
Mineral License  012916M 
Held by    British Canadian Mines Ltd. 
Situate near   Baie Verte Area 
On map sheet   12H/16         
 
Mineral License  012921M 
Held by    Brushett, Boyd 
Situate near   Southwest Arm Area, 
     Burin Peninsula 
On map sheet   01M/03         
 
Mineral License  012928M 
Held by    Stares, Robert T. 
Situate near   Round Brook, 
     Great Northern Peninsula 
On map sheet   12I/06        
  
The lands covered by this notice except for the lands within 
Exempt Mineral Lands, the Exempt Mineral Lands being 
described in CNLR1143/96 and NLR71/98, 104/98, 
97/2000, 36/2001, 31/2004, 78/2006 and 8/2008 and 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

106  

outlined on 1:50 000 scale digital maps maintained by the 
Department of Natural Resources, will be open for staking 
after the hour of 9:00 a.m. on the 32nd clear day after the 
date of this publication. 
 

JIM HINCHEY P.Geo 
Manager - Mineral Rights 

 
File # 774:2609, 6558, 7548, 7794, 7799, 7806 

 
Apr 4 

LANDS ACT 

NOTICE OF INTENT 

LANDS ACT, Chapter 36, S.N. 1991 

Notice is hereby given that CLARENCE STONE of 
Norris Point, NL intends to apply to the Department of 
Environment and Conservation, two months from the 
publication of this Notice, to acquire title, pursuant to 
Section 7(2) (a) of the said Act, to that piece of Crown 
Land situated within fifteen (15) metres of the waters of 
Norris Point, Bonne Bay, in the Electoral District of 
Humber St. Barbe for the purpose of a Craft Store and 
being more particularly described as follows: 

Bounded on the North by Stones Lane 
for a distance of 21 m;  

Bounded on the East by Crown Land 
for a distance of 14 m;  

Bounded on the South by Waters of Norris Point 
for a distance of 21 m;  

Bounded on the West by Crown Land 
for a distance of 9 m;  

and containing an area of  
approximately 250 square metres. 

Any person wishing to object to the application must 
file the objection, in writing, within one month from the 
publication of this notice, with reasons for it, to the 
Minister of Environment and Conservation, c/o Western 
Regional Lands Office, P. O. Box 2006, Noton Building, 
Corner Brook, NL A2H 6J8. 

For further information on the proposed application, 
please contact CLARENCE STONE, Telephone (709) 458-
2378. 

Apr 4 

CHANGE OF NAME ACT 
 

C-8 RSNL 1990 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 
 

WANDA JENNY WALSH 

 
of P. O. Box 3006, RR#2, Corner Brook, A2H 6B9,  in the 
Province of Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my name from 

WANDA JENNY WALSH 
to 

WANDA JENNY PATEY 
 

To change my minor unmarried children’s name from 
 

DONALD WAYNE THOMAS WALSH 
to 

DONALD WAYNE THOMAS PATEY 
 

DEVON DEON WALSH 
to 

DEVON DEON PATEY 
 

DATED this 20th day of March, 2008. 

WANDA JENNY WALSH 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 
 

MAURA MAHER 
 

of General Delivery, Bird Cove, in the Province of 
Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my name from 

MAURA MAHER 
to 

MARINA MAHAR 

DATED this 19th  day of March, 2008. 

MAURA MAHER 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

 
VIRGINIA MARGARET BAKER 

 
of 47 Highroad North, Carbonear, A1Y 1A8, in the 
Province of Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried child’s name from 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

107  

CAMERON KENNETH BAKER SOMERS 
to 

CAMERON KENNETH BAKER 
 

DATED this 19th   day of March, 2008. 

VIRGINIA MARGARET BAKER 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

SUZANNE LILLY 
 
of 6A Edmonton Place, St. John’s, A1A  2N7, in the 
Province of Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried child’s name from 

JOSHUA JOHN FRANCIS BUTT 
to 

JOSHUA JOHN FRANCIS LILLY 
 

DATED this 25th day of March, 2008. 

SUZANNE LILLY 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

ASHLEY MICHELLE FINN 
 
of 94 Codroy Place, St. John’s, A1E 4J1, in the Province of 
Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried children’s name from 

CONNOR BRADLEY FINN-KILFOY 
to 

CONNOR BRADLEY FINN 
 

CODY SHAWN FINN-KILFOY 
to 

CODY SHAWN FINN 
 

DATED this 5th day of February, 2008. 

ASHLEY MICHELLE FINN 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

CATHERINE LEE FINN 
 

of 29 Coventry Way, St. John’s, A1E 6H3, in the Province 
of Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried children’s name from 

ISABELLA CATHERINE ALICIA FINN-HAGERMAN 
to 

ISABELLA CATHERINE ALICIA FINN HAGERMAN 

MICHEAL PADRAIG FINN-HAGERMAN 
to 

MICHEAL PADRAIG FINN HAGERMAN 

DATED this 20th  day of March, 2008. 

CATHERINE LEE FINN 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

LISA CAROL QUIRION 
 

of 32 MacBeth Drive, St. John’s, A1A 6A4 in the Province 
of Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried child’s name from 

SCOTT JEREMY MUGFORD 
to 

SCOTT JEREMY MUGFORD-QUIRION 

DATED this 31st  day of March, 2008. 

LISA CAROL QUIRION 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

DIANNE BENNETT 
 

of 30 Tudor Street, Corner Brook, A2H 6S8, in the 
Province of Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried child’s name from 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

108  

DANIELLE REBECCA CAMMIE 
to 

DANIELLE REBECCA BENNETT 
 

DATED this 28th  day of March, 2008. 

DIANNE BENNETT 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION 
FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

NOTICE is hereby given that an application will be made 
to the Minister of Government Services for a change of 
name, pursuant to the provisions of the Change of Name 
Act, by me:- 

FRANCES FREAKE 
 

of 92 Codroy Place, St. John’s, A1E 4J1, in the Province of 
Newfoundland and Labrador, as follows: 

To change my minor unmarried child’s name from 

HAYLEY ELLEN RAMONA DAVIS 
to 

HAYLEY ELLEN RAMONA FREAKE 
 

DATED this 20th   day of March, 2008. 

FRANCES FREAKE 
(Signature of Applicant) 

Apr 4 

 
 
 

GEOGRAPHICAL NAMES BOARD ACT 
 
 

NOTICE 
 
 
Under the authority of Section 6(1), of the Newfoundland 
and Labrador Geographical Names Board Act, cG-3, 
RSNL 1990, the Minister of the Department of 
Environment and Conservation, hereby approves the names 
of places or geographical features as recommended by the 
Newfoundland and Labrador Geographical Names Board 
and as printed in Decision List 2008-01.  
 
DATED at St. John's this 20th  day of March, 2008. 
 

CHARLENE JOHNSON 
Minister 

Department of Environment and Conservation 
 
 

Newfoundland and Labrador  
Geographical Names Board  

 
Decision List 2008-01 

 
Source of Recommendation: 
 
This document contains a list of 998 names of places or 
geographical features which were discussed during the last 
twelve meetings of the Newfoundland and Labrador 
Geographical Names Board.  The dates of these Board 
Meetings were October 28-29, 2004; January 13-14, 2005; 
May 26-27, 2005; October 20-21, 2005; December 1-2, 
2005; April 27-28, 2006; September 14-15, 2006; 
November 16-17, 2006; January 25-26, 2007; May 31 - 
June 1, 2007; September 13-14, 2007 and December 12-14, 
2007. These recommendations affect the National 
Topographic Series (NTS) mapsheets: Biscay Bay River 
(1K/14); Lamaline (1L/13); Gaultois (1M/12); St. Alban’s 
(1M/13); Ferryland (1N/2); St. Catherine’s (1N/3); 
Placentia (1N/4); Holyrood (1N/6); St. John’s (1N/10); 
Sweet Bay (2C/5); Eastport (2C/12); Tug Pond (2D/1); 
Gambo (2D/16); Little Fogo Islands (2E/16); Quirpon 
(2M/11); St. Peter Bay (3D/4); Fox Harbour (3D/5); 
Codroy (11O/14); Facheaux Bay (11P/9); Ramea (11P/11); 
Burgeo (11P/12); Peter Snout (11P/13); White Bear River 
(11P/14); Georges Lake (12B/16); Bay of Islands (12G/1); 
Trout River (12G/8); Hampden (12H/10); Silver Mountain 
(12H/11); Gros Morne (12H/12); Main River (12H/14); 
Jacksons Arm (12H/15); Bellburns (12I/6); Englee (12I/9); 
Torrent River (12I/10); Port Saunders (12I/11); Castors 
River (12I/15); Roddickton (12I/16); Flower’s Cove 
(12P/7); Big Brook (12P/9); Pinware (12P/10); Barge Bay 
(12P/16); Chateau Bay (13A/1); St. Lewis Inlet (13A/8); 
Port Hope Simpson (13A/9); (untitled) (13A/10); Jeffries 
Pond (13A/15); White Bear Arm (13A/16); (untitled) 
(13H/3); (untitled) (13H/4); (untitled) (13H/5); Paradise 
River (13H/6); Cartwright (13H/11) and Saglek Bight 
(14L/10).  
 
These names were the result of several independent field 
surveys from members of the general public over the past 
six years.  
 
In an attempt to assist the Department of Transportation 
and Works to collect names along the Trans Labrador 
Highway, the Department of Environment and 
Conservation also conducted another field survey from Red 
Bay to Cartwright.  This survey was conducted in the fall of 
2005.  The efforts of the data collectors and informants are 
gratefully acknowledged. 
 
In the fall of 2007 the Canadian Coast Guard notified the 
Newfoundland and Labrador Geographical Names Board 
that there were some feature name inaccuracies on some of 
the hydrographic charts in the Bay of Islands region of the 
province.  Search and rescue efforts were delayed when 
confusion arose over the discrepancy between locally used 
geographical feature names and those used on the 
hydrographic charts by search and rescue personnel.  These 
former names have now been changed to reflect those in 
long standing local usage. 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

109  

  



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

110  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

111  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

112  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

113  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

114  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

115  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

116  



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

117  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

118  



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

119  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

120  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

121  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

122  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

123  



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

124  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

125  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

126  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

127  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

128  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

129  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

130  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

131  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

132  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

133  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

134  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

135  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

136  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

137  

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
April 4, 2008 

138  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Apr 4 

  



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

THE NEWFOUNDLAND 
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE 

 
 

PART II 

SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION 
FILED UNDER THE STATUTES AND SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION ACT 

Vol. 83 ST. JOHN’S, THURSDAY, APRIL 4, 2008 No. 14
 

 

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 

REGULATION 

NLR 19/08 
 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 



  
 

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette  April 4, 2008 
 

127 

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR 
REGULATION 19/08 

Income and Employment Support Regulations  
(Amendment)  

under the  
Income and Employment Support Act  

(O.C. 2008-088)  

(Filed April 1, 2008) 

Under the authority of section 52 of the Income and Support Act, 
the Lieutenant-Governor in Council makes the following regulations. 

Dated at St. John’s, March 28, 2008. 

Gary Norris  
Clerk of the Executive Council  

REGULATIONS 

Analysis 

 1.  S.13 Amdt 
Maintaining a residence 

 2.  S.14 R&S 
Maximum monthly income 
support-board and lodging 

 3.  S.15 Amdt. 
Income support for persons 
30 years of age and younger 

 1. Subsection 13(1) of the Income and Employment Support 
Regulations is repealed and the following substituted: 

NLR 144/04 
as amended 



 Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

19/08 

 

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette  April 4, 2008 
 

128 

 13. (1) The monthly amount of income support for an applicant or 
recipient who is renting or owns a residence is up to  

 
1 adult  without dependent children  $465  
1 adult  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

659  

1 adult  without dependent children 
but with two dependent stu-
dents  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
1 adult  with dependent children  604  
1 adult  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
647  

1 adult  with dependent children but 
with two dependent students  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  without dependent children  659  
2 adults  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  with dependent children  647  
2 adults  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

 2. Section 14 of the regulations is repealed and the following 
substituted: 

 14. (1) The monthly amount of income support for an applicant or 
recipient who is boarding with a non-relative is 

 
1 adult  without dependent children  $465  
1 adult  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

659  

1 adult  without dependent children 
and two dependent students  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

Maintaining a 
residence 

 

Maximum monthly 
income support-
board and lodging 



 Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

19/08 

 

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette  April 4, 2008 
 

129 

dependent student  
1 adult  with dependent children  604  
1 adult  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
647  

1 adult  with dependent children and 
two dependent students  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  without dependent children  659  
2 adults  without dependent children 

and one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

2 adults  with dependent children  647  
2 adults  with dependent children with 

one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

 (2) The monthly amount of income support for board and lodg-
ing for an applicant or recipient who is boarding with a relative is 

 
1 adult  without dependent children  $282  
1 adult  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

559  

1 adult  with dependent children  497  
1 adult  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
647 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  

2 adults  without dependent children  559  
2 adults  without dependent children 

but with one dependent stu-
dent  

751 plus 105 for 
each additional 

dependent student  
2 adults  with dependent children  647  
2 adults  with dependent children and 

one dependent student  
751 plus 105 for 

each additional 
dependent student  



 Income and Employment Support Regulations 
(Amendment) 

19/08 

 

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette  April 4, 2008 
 

130 

 3. (1) Subsection 15(1) of the regulations is amended by delet-
ing the amount "$221" and replacing it with the amount "$224". 

 (2) Paragraph 15(2)(a) of the regulations is amended by 
deleting the amount "$105" and replacing it with the amount 
"$107". 

 (3) Paragraph 15(2)(b) of the regulations is amended by 
deleting the amount "$152" and replacing it with the amount 
"$154".  

 (4) Subsection 15(3) is of the regulations amended by delet-
ing the amount "$435" and replacing it with the amount "$442". 

©Earl G. Tucker, Queen's Printer 

 



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE 
April 4, 2008 

 

131 

 

Index 
PART I 

Change of Name Act – Applications ........................................................................................................................................... 106 
Geographical Names Board Act – Notice .................................................................................................................................... 108 
Lands Act – Notice ...................................................................................................................................................................... 106 
Mineral Act – Notices .................................................................................................................................................................. 105 
 
 

PART II 

CONTINUING INDEX OF SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION 

Title of Act and 
Subordinate Legislation CNLR or  NL Gazette 
made thereunder NL Reg. Amendment Date & Page No. 

 
Income and Employment Support Act 
 
    
 Income and Employment NLR 19/08 Amends  Apr 4/08,   p. 127 
 Support Regulations  NLR144/04 
 (Amdt)  S.13 Amdt.  
   S.14 R & S 
 S.15 Amdt. 

   Extraordinary 
   April 1/08 
        



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE 
April 4, 2008 

 

132 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette is published from the office of Earl G. Tucker, Queen’s Printer. 

Copy for publication must be received before Friday, 4:30 p.m., seven days before publication, to ensure inclusion in next issue. 
Advertisements should be typewritten or printed legibly, separate from covering letter. Number of insertions required must be stated 
and the names of all signing officers typewritten or printed. 

Advertising rates are available upon request. Subscription rate for The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette is $125.00 for 52 
weeks plus applicable tax (131.25). Weekly issues of $3.00 per copy, plus tax payable in advance. 

All cheques, money orders, etc., should be made payable to THE NEWFOUNDLAND EXCHEQUER ACCOUNT and all 
correspondence should be addressed to: Office of the Queen’s Printer, P. O. Box 8700, Ground Floor, East Block, Confederation 
Building, St. John’s, NL A1B 4J6. Telephone (709) 729-3649.  Fax: (709) 729-1900. 

 

Web Site:   TUwww.gov.nl.ca/queensprinterUT 

 

 

 

Place your order by contacting: 
Office of The Queen’s Printer 

Confederation Building, East Block 
St. John’s,  NL  A1B 4J6 

Telephone: (709) 729-3649  Fax:  (709) 729-1900 
email:  queensprinter@gov.nl.ca 

 

Government Information Product 
Publication Rate Mail 

G.S.T. # R107442683 

All requests for Subscription and Legislation MUST be prepaid. 

 

 


	Queen's Printer Web Site

	Index
	CHANGE OF NAME ACT
	ASHLEY MICHELLE FINN
	CATHERINE LEE FINN
	DIANNE BENNETT
	FRANCES FREAKE
	LISA CAROL QUIRION
	MAURA MAHER
	SUZANNE LILLY
	VIRGINIA MARGARET BAKER
	WANDA JENNY WALSH

	GEOGRAPHICAL NAMES BOARD ACT
	Decision List 2008-01

	LANDS ACT
	CLARENCE STONE

	MINERAL ACT
	CORRECTION NOTICE
	British Canadian Mines Ltd
	Brushett, Boyd
	Galen Gypsum Mines Limited
	Stares, Robert T.
	Ucore Uranium Inc
	Vulcan Minerals Inc

	REGULATION
	19/08






